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Bl ‘Church, Lisa" <Lisa.Church@fdacs.gov>  Jfl] Sean Arnold

Tim,

Good Afternoon. | have verified with the Florida Department of Agriculture and
Consumer Services that your site has received EFT payments into the account that
is on file with My Florida Market Place within two to three business days of the state
processing the claim. Your site has received claims for meals from
August-December for a total of $14,021.64.

Per our agreement For Each 1 Reach 1 is expected to pay the Hernando
County School District for meals provided August-December for a total of $26,611.8(
and for all meals provided within 30 of the invoice provided by FNS. This is the final
notice that the Hernando County School District-Food and Nutrition Services expects
to receive payment for meals vended to For Each 1 Reach 1. If payment for August-
December is not provided by January 31, 2023 consider this notice that | will be
presenting my recommendation to the School Board at the February 14, 2023
meeting to terminate of the Memorandum of Understanding to Vend Meals between
the District School Board of Hernando County and For Each 1 Reach 1 effective
close of business on March 17, 2023.

Please let me know if there is anything | can do to be of assistance.
Lori Drenth, M.S., R.D., S.N.S.
Director, Food and Nutrition Services

Hernando County School District

Principal ForEach1 <principal@foreachi.org> writes:

Good afternoon,

I have reached out to the payment people for the Food Program. It is showing paid, however, we have
not received any payments or checks. I am waiting to hear from them and I will keep you posted.

I am sorry. I am confused about why we have not received any payments.

Thank you for reaching out.
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##*This email is confidential and is intended for the use of the named recipient only. If you have
received this message in error, please inform us immediately and delete it.***

Timothy D. Wert

Principal

For Each 1 Reach 1 Mentoring Program, Inc.
Reach Academy

7318 Sunshine Grove Rd.

Brooksville, FL. 34613

Office Phone: 352-556-2768

Fax: 1-877-330-4468

Website: www.foreach lreachl.com
principal@foreachl.org

On Wed, Jan 4, 2023 at 11:16 AM Lori Drenth <drenth I@hcsb.k12.fl.us> wrote:

Tim,

Good Morning. Attached is the invoice for meals served to For Each 1
Reach 1 for the month of December 2022. Additionally, the invoices from
the beginning of the school year remain outstanding. The terms of the
agreement are not being met by your facility. If full payment for
August-November is not received by January 20, 2023 then Food and
Nutrition Services will consider terminating this agreement. Please reach
ouf to me and let me know what is happening and what can be done to meet
the agreement,

August-  $5,952.55
September - $5,867.20
October -  $6,439.00
November - $4,489.60
December - $3,863.40

TOTAL: $26,611.80
Lori Drenth, M.S., R.D., S.N.S.

Director, Food and Nutrition Services
Hernando County School District

IMPORTANT NOTICE:All e-mails sent to this address are public record unless
specifically exempted by Florida law, and are archived accordingly. The
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School District does not allow use of School District equipment and e-mail
for non-School District business purposes.



